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Pregnant women’s desire for private ultrasound
examination in the first trimester

The women in this study wanted information and confirmation that
their pregnancy was progressing normally in the first trimester. For
them, a private ultrasound examination was a good investment.
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Abstract
Background: Ultrasound examinations in the first trimester have not previously been part of
the antenatal care in Norway’s public health care service. Steadily more pregnant women are
arranging to have a private ultrasound examination in the early stages of pregnancy.

Objective: To gain a deeper understanding of what motivates healthy women to have a
private ultrasound examination in the first trimester of pregnancy.
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Method: A qualitative design with an inductive approach was used in the study. We collected
the data material from individual interviews with eight pregnant women. We used a semi-
structured interview guide, and the data material was analysed by means of systematic text
condensation.

Results: The women reported a lack of information from healthcare personnel in the first
trimester. On the recommendation of friends and family, they arranged a private ultrasound
examination in order to obtain more general information and to confirm the pregnancy and
that the fetus was developing normally. The women wanted visual confirmation, and this
strengthened their bond with the baby.

Conclusion: The women did not feel that they received sufficient follow-up from the midwife
and GP in the first trimester. They considered a private ultrasound examination to be a good
investment at a time when they were in great need of information and confirmation that the
pregnancy was progressing normally.

Unlike other Scandinavian countries, Norway has not offered ultrasound examinations in the
first trimester as part of the antenatal care in the public health care service.

Pregnant women with a known or increased risk of complications as well as women over the
age of 38 have been offered prenatal diagnostic testing, which includes an ultrasound
examination between weeks 11 and 13 �1, 2�.

A report by the Norwegian Knowledge Centre for the Health Services �1� included a
discussion on the public health care service supplementing the ultrasound in week 18 with an
early ultrasound examination in week 11�13.

On 26 May 2020, the Norwegian parliament �Storting) passed an amendment to the
Biotechnology Act, which meant that as part of their antenatal care, all pregnant women in
their first trimester would routinely be offered ultrasound and an extra examination, which
can reveal serious illness or fetal injury �3�.

Technological developments and the introduction of 3�D imaging has led to an increase in
ultrasound examinations, also for non-medical reasons �4�. An ultrasound examination in the
first trimester represents a milestone for many women and marks a new and safe phase in
their pregnancy �5�.

Women undergo private ultrasound examinations in order to obtain information about the
health, development and sex of the fetus �6�.

A Norwegian study �7� showed that women who were found to be at a low risk of fetal
chromosomal abnormalities in an ultrasound examination in the first trimester, felt more
reassured during their pregnancy, and developed a strong bond with their unborn child. The
women also wanted to be prepared in the event that the examination showed developmental
abnormalities.



Williams et al. �8� point out that some women want ultrasound screening in the first trimester
so that they can terminate the pregnancy earlier if the examination shows serious fetal
abnormalities.

A pregnancy represents a new and unknown situation over which women have no control.
Øyen and Aune �9� report that understanding and care from healthcare personnel are
important at a time when pregnant women feel vulnerable. GPs and midwives have the
primary responsibility for antenatal care.

Pregnant women are free to choose whether they want to receive antenatal care from their
GP or a midwife. However, the midwifery service is limited in many municipalities, which
means that the service provision is often non-existent or insufficient to cover the demand
�10�.

A mismatch in the supply and demand in midwifery services has resulted in more private
actors offering antenatal care in the last ten years �11�.

In light of this, there has also been an increase in the number of pregnant women paying to
take private ultrasound examinations in the first trimester. According to Hanger �12�, over 70
per cent of pregnant women in Norwegian cities use this service.

Objective of the study

The purpose of this study was to gain a deeper understanding of what motivates pregnant
women to take a private ultrasound examination in the first trimester of pregnancy.

Method
Data collection

We collected the data material through qualitative interviews. Prior to the interviews, we
prepared a semi-structured interview guide that consisted of questions aimed at gaining a
deeper understanding of why pregnant women on their own initiative wanted to arrange a
private ultrasound examination in the first trimester �Table 1�.



Sample

Pregnant women from six different public health clinics in two Norwegian cities were
recruited to the study. Midwives at the public health clinics distributed information leaflets to
pregnant women at antenatal appointments. The women who were interested in participating
in the study contacted the researchers themselves.

We emphasised that the participants themselves should choose the time and place of the
interview. The inclusion criteria were pregnant women who, on their own initiative, had
decided to have an ultrasound examination performed privately in the first trimester.

At the time of the interview, the women had to have undergone the ultrasound examination in
week 18 and received confirmation of a healthy fetus. The women also had to be over 18
years old, speak Norwegian and not have undergone fetal diagnostic testing. The final sample
consisted of eight pregnant women aged 27�35 years.

Four participants were primiparous women and four were multiparous mothers. Two of the
women lived in west Norway, while the remainder lived in east Norway. All the women had a
higher education and lived with a partner.

Ethical considerations

The participants signed a consent form prior to the interview. They were informed that
participation was voluntary and confidential, and that they were free to withdraw from the
study if they so wished.
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We anonymised sensitive and personal data to protect the participants and reduce the risk of
them being identified. The study was approved by the Norwegian Centre for Research Data
(reference number 60678�.

Data analysis

We recorded the interviews on audiotape and transcribed the recordings after each interview.
The data material was analysed using systematic text condensation �13�. In the first step of
the analysis, we formed an overall impression of the material, and then formulated preliminary
themes.

In step two, we systematically reviewed the material and identified meaning units that
reflected the experiences and perceptions of the pregnant women. The meaning units were
then sorted into groups and coded.

In step three, we sorted the meaning units into sub-groups, and each sub-group was
reformulated into a condensate that summarised the sub-group in question. In step four, we
wrote an analytical text for each condensate. Each of the code groups was then given a
heading �Tables 2 and 3�.
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Results
Taking responsibility for own antenatal follow-up

The category describes the pregnant women’s experiences of receiving insufficient antenatal
information from the GP and the midwife early in their pregnancy. Social influence had a large
bearing on the decision to have a private ultrasound in the first trimester.

Insufficient information

The women explained that the first trimester was an uncertain time during which a number of
questions and concerns arose about the pregnancy. Some of them read the books and
brochures they were given by their midwife or GP, but most said that the internet, family and
friends were the main sources of information.

The participants were aware that much of the online content is not written by professionals,
and that the information is not always based on knowledge:

‘You search a lot online, and you see a lot of conflicting information […] You think you’re
finding out things, but then you’re left with perhaps more questions than answers.’ �Tuva)

«Some participants had to fight to get an early appointment with the
midwife at the public health clinic.»

The participants wished they had received more information from healthcare personnel at the
start of their pregnancy. Several of the primiparous women did not know what the antenatal
follow-up from the public health care service entailed, and not everyone was aware that they
had the choice of going to a midwife or GP or a combination.

Some participants had to fight to get an early appointment with the midwife at the public
health clinic. During that stage of pregnancy, they had a great need for information and had
many thoughts and feelings that they needed to talk about:

‘I thought, my God, I’m not going to talk to anyone until week 12? I thought it was a long time
to wait. Before that, I had no contact with anyone, really, other than listening to my own body.’
�Tone)
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The women said that the quality of the information they received about the pregnancy at the
first check-up varied, and they felt that it was a long time until the next check-up. They
therefore sought out a private health care service and believed that the ultrasound
examination was a good source of information in the early stages of pregnancy.

Several of the women said that the antenatal care in the public health care service should
include an ultrasound examination in the first trimester, and that it should not only be offered
to those in the risk groups.

The multiparous mothers’ decision to have a private ultrasound examination was based on
previous positive experiences of this. These women would also choose a private ultrasound in
any potential future pregnancies and would recommend the examination to others:

‘You find out that you’re pregnant in week 4 or 5, but then you don’t get a check-up from your
GP until week 8�9, so you just have to sit around twiddling your thumbs while you wait to get
into some system or other. So there’s plenty time to think and ponder on things in the
beginning […] In that sense, I think that the offer of an early ultrasound helps to catch you at
an early stage, when you need more information about how everything is progressing.’ �Elin)

Social influence

Most of the women were made aware of the private ultrasound examination through friends
and family. Many had also read online that it was normal to have this examination, and they
described the offer as an easily accessible service. Several of them felt obliged to have the
examination performed to find out if the fetus was healthy and developing normally:

‘You worry that something might be wrong. And when you’re given good news, you can relax
a bit. It’s never 100% certain, but at least you’ve done what you can to find out if your baby is
doing well.’ �Siri) 

«Some women said that their partner took it for granted that they would
have an ultrasound examination early in the pregnancy.»

The participants explained that they decided to have their partner present during the private
ultrasound examination to make them more included in the pregnancy.

Some women said that their partner took it for granted that they would have an ultrasound
examination early in the pregnancy, and that this was part of the reason why they decided to
have this examination:

‘There’s two of us in this, and this was when we would get to see the baby together for the
first time. He took it for granted that he would be involved in this.’ �Siri)

Need for confirmation and visualisation

This category relates to the women’s need for predictability and reassurance early in the
pregnancy. The category also describes the visualisation of the fetus, which marked the
beginning of parenthood.



Confirmation that everything is normal

The women indicated that they felt a need for confirmation of the pregnancy in the first
trimester. Some said they had few subjective signs of pregnancy, and they were worried,
even though the pregnancy test was positive.

Several of the participants wanted an early ultrasound examination before informing friends
and family that they were pregnant. Some were in poor physical shape during the first
trimester. Visual confirmation of the fetus gave relief and reassurance and helped motivate
them:

‘None of the things that you associate with a pregnancy are there. You don’t feel very
pregnant. You don’t just trust a urine test. So it’s partly to do with getting confirmation that it’s
there, and if it looks okay. It gives us reassurance that we’re actually pregnant.’ �Siri)

Some of the women reported having several private ultrasound examinations during the first
trimester. This was because they had repeated concerns about whether the pregnancy was
progressing normally and whether the fetus was healthy.

The participants described the first trimester as an uncertain time marked by anxiety and
negative thoughts. Consequently, the women had an extra need for confirmation that
everything was normal in the first twelve weeks:

‘It wasn’t enough with the one in week 8. It was probably because they can’t say very much at
that examination, because they can’t see very much. So I calmed down for a while, but my
concerns and overthinking started up again. It was easy to order another examination in
week 12. Because I thought, at least this way you’re more sure that it will go well.’ �Ingrid)

Another reason why the women wanted a private ultrasound examination was to check that
the fetus did not have any diseases or syndromes. Some participants said that they would
have considered having an abortion if the ultrasound examination had revealed
developmental abnormalities in the fetus, while others wanted to be able to plan for life with a
child that was potentially impaired in some way. They pointed out that they would want to be
given such news as early as possible in their pregnancy:

‘For us, it wasn’t necessarily about deciding about an abortion if the ultrasound revealed an
unhealthy fetus, it was more about preparing to live with a sick child. Having plenty time to
plan. If the fetus had been so unhealthy that you would have to have an abortion, you can do
it in week 10 or 12 instead of week 20.’ �Tone)

Bonding with the baby

For the women, the desire for a visual image of the fetus was a major motivating factor for
having a private ultrasound examination in the first trimester. They said it was a special
moment that they were looking forward to with their partner.

«The participants said that seeing the fetus early in the pregnancy was a
very valuable experience.»



They explained that they wanted to see who was ‘occupying’ their uterus, and that they
thought it would create a stronger bond to the unborn baby. They emphasised that the
visualisation and bonding would better prepare them for becoming parents:

‘It was so special seeing your baby on a big screen for the first time. I think it’s the nicest
moment my boyfriend and I have shared. Seeing that tiny little baby that we will be parents
to.’ �Siri)

The participants said that seeing the fetus early in the pregnancy was a very valuable
experience. Several pointed out that once they received news that everything looked normal,
they were able to relax and focus more on the visual experience of the examination:

‘After we found out that everything was normal, it was an even better feeling. We saw the
baby for the first time, he shook his head and moved. It was magical.’ �Anita)

Discussion
The participants described the first weeks of pregnancy as an uncertain time with fluctuating
emotions. The first trimester of pregnancy is a vulnerable time that is often marked by
insecurity and anxiety �14�.

Such psychological reactions are normal, but it is important to recognise and address them
�15, 16�. The women had a great need for information and sought knowledge via the internet,
family and friends, brochures and books. They felt that they had little contact with the
midwife or GP early in the pregnancy.

It is not uncommon for pregnant women to receive pregnancy-related information through
channels other than healthcare personnel, and solely receiving written information does not
improve knowledge to any great extent �17�.

However, pregnant women read what they want and interpret written information based on
their own coping strategies �18�.

Early appointment can allay concerns

The participants felt that they had to wait a long time for their first antenatal appointment.
They described how the concerns they had at the start of the pregnancy could have been
prevented if they had had a conversation with the midwife or GP at an earlier stage.

Normal anxiety in pregnant women can be alleviated through good support and information
from healthcare personnel �10, 19�. They should therefore be offered an appointment as early
as possible in the first trimester �10�. They have the right to information about their own state
of health and the health care they receive, as well as the right to decision-making
involvement and participation �20�.

The midwifery service is limited in many municipalities, and many women in the cities
therefore use private health care services �12�. The participants considered a private
ultrasound examination to be a good investment at a time when they had a great need for
information.



«For the women in this study, the ultrasound examination in the first
trimester gave them reassurance.»

Ekelin et al. �21� observed that women feel less worried after an ultrasound examination.
However, it is important that sufficient time is set aside for the examination, and that the
information provided is adapted to the couple’s needs �22�.

The women wanted information about complications that could arise during pregnancy. Being
pregnant is an unfamiliar situation over which they have no control. However, pregnant
women have a high level of trust in the health care service �23�.

Before pregnant women undergo an ultrasound examination, they are often anxious that
there may be something wrong with the fetus �24�. This may reflect the growing trend of
healthy, pregnant women who on their own initiative arrange for private ultrasound
examinations in Norway �12�.

For the women in this study, the ultrasound examination in the first trimester gave them
reassurance, and this had a positive impact on their mental health during pregnancy. This is
confirmed in other studies which show that when pregnant women feel reassured, they are
able to regain control and are better equipped to deal with pregnancy �5, 7, 25�.

A positive pregnancy test is not sufficient

The participants had few signs of pregnancy in the first trimester and did not consider a
positive pregnancy test alone to be sufficient confirmation of the pregnancy. They therefore
had a private ultrasound examination in order to get definite confirmation of the pregnancy,
as other studies also show �5, 19, 25�.

Women can have concerns about whether the fetus is developing normally. This is especially
the case in the early stages of pregnancy when bodily changes are not yet noticeable �26�.

Several studies show that women mark the time after the ultrasound examination as a new
and safe phase in pregnancy. Once they are told that everything looks normal during the
examination, they can start adapting to the role of parent �5, 9, 17, 27�.

One of the major motivating factors for the participants was the visualisation of the fetus
together with their partner. Women use ultrasound examination early in pregnancy as a way
of being able to share the experience of pregnancy with their partner �19�.

Visualisation and personification through an ultrasound examination also create a stronger
bond with the fetus �7�. Developments in ultrasound technology have led to an increase in
ultrasound examinations, including for non-medical reasons �4�.

Women feel that a private ultrasound examination is something that their partner, friends and
family expect them to have. Social pressure of this nature can also be regarded as a factor in
the normalisation of ultrasound examinations in the first trimester of pregnancy �7�.



All pregnant women can now have an early ultrasound examination

This study was conducted before the new provision on universal early ultrasound
examinations in the Biotechnology Act was adopted in May 2020. The participants wanted
the ultrasound examination in the first trimester to be part of the antenatal care in the public
health care service so that abnormal findings could be identified at an early stage.

Previous Norwegian studies show that women want to have an ultrasound examination in
order to get information about the health of the fetus �9�, and that an ultrasound examination
in the first trimester should be a universal offer, and not just for those in the risk groups �7�.

The participants’ experiences with the private ultrasound examination were positive and they
would recommend it to others. It can therefore be assumed that such recommendations are
contributing to the normalisation of private ultrasound examinations in the first trimester. 

Weaknesses of the study

In this study, a small group of pregnant women shared their thoughts on private ultrasound
examinations in the first trimester of pregnancy. The sample is therefore limited, and due to
the qualitative design of the study, the women’s experiences are not necessarily
representative of all pregnant women.

However, the participants spoke freely about the topic and provided rich and comprehensive
descriptions that helped to give depth to the study and led to a greater understanding of the
phenomenon being studied. All the women had a higher education and lived with a partner,
which limits the transfer value of the study.

Conclusion
The women felt that the follow-up from the midwife and GP in the first trimester was
insufficient. They considered a private ultrasound examination to be a good investment at a
time when they had a great need for information and confirmation that the pregnancy was
progressing normally.

The findings of the study illustrate that women need an appointment with a midwife or GP in
the early stages of pregnancy to ensure they receive the care they need.

The authors would like to thank all the women for taking part in the study.
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